
Major Flooring Brand, Great Margins, Great Town
Part of a recognised brand with a proven 30 year history in the
flooring industry, this nationwide branded company has
enjoyed revenue growth year on year since opening,
achieving margins above average industry benchmarks. With
over 6 years trading history, this business's current financial
years' results to date shows a steady upwards trend.
 
With a large range of residential and domestic clients, the
business targets work opportunities via a network of builders,
architects, specifiers, local body and health providers and has
formed a client base which has grown consistently given the
increasing spread of people to the area. As a member of a
large buying group that pride themselves in working together
to ensure customer satisfaction and supply of top quality
products at competitive pricing this has cemented them as a
major player in their industry. This group work closely
together and are a strong bonded team with the individual
members taking an interactive role in the future development
of the brand.
 
Based just 1.5 hours' drive from Auckland by car, the location
offers you a fantastic lifestyle in a clean green environment,
surrounded by many popular holiday destinations. There is a
large modern showroom with excellent warehousing facilities
and plenty of off street parking. A large profitable platform
has been achieved with further growth easily reachable with
your input!
 
Owner operated with one very experienced employee as well
as self-employed installation contractors - Industry
experience not essential to a new purchaser! So... what are
you waiting for? Escape the rat race to live the better life.
 
All this for $520,000, includes stock.
 
If you are interested and would like more information about
this business, visit www.barkerbusiness.co.nz, register your

Price SOLD
Ref BBS2046

Agent Details

Neil Barker - 021 957 095

Office Details

Barker Business Brokerage
0064 9 448 1285

Sold



this business, visit www.barkerbusiness.co.nz, register your
details and submit the online Confidentiality Agreement for
reference #2046. Once Craig receives your expression of
interest he will be in touch.
 
*Source of information - Supplied by the Business Owner.


